
NU CHEX TO CASH 
 
 

NRHA HALL OF FAME 
NRHA THREE MILLION DOLLAR SIRE 
 
Nu Chex To Cash is a “Once In A Life Time Horse.” We purchased him as a long 5 year old. He 
had earned 10.5 AQHA Points and $3800 NRHA when we purchased him. He went on to win 
381 AQHA points and over $61,000. He carried Charlie Hutton to many many wins showing over 
400 times before he started his NRHA career with my daughter Jessicah. Besides his AQHA 
career winning the AQHA High Point in Reining and Cow Horse the same year (no other horse 
has done this before) he packed my youngest daughter Sarah around the arenas doing walk 
trot. I guess that tells you what kind of mind he has. To Nu Chex right was right and left was left 
and whoa meant stop! He was such an honest guy and had a huge heart! We are finding this 
same kind of heart and work ethic with his son Heavy Duty Chex. My daughter Jessicah Keller 
took the reins of Nu Chex when he was 12 years old. Jessicah was 17. This was our introduction 
to NRHA events! That year she showed Nu Chex and won the Limited Open and Intermediate 
Open World Championships, was Reserve Non Pro and Intermediate Non Pro World Champions 
and was top 10 in Novice Horse all on Nu Chex To Cash. She also showed Tejons Texie Lena to 
the Novice Non Pro World Championship and that mare was later bred to Nu Chex To Cash 
producing Nu Chexomatic who also became NRHA Open World Champion!  
 
Nu Chex To Cash sired Wimpys Little Step – NRHA Futurity Champion and now is a NRHA 9 
Million Dollar Sire! He also sired Big Chex To Cash NRHA Futurity and Derby Reserve Champion 
earning over $220,000; Lil Joe Cash – NRHA Futurity Champion and Nu Chex highest money 
earning offspring; Night Deposit Chex – AQHA, NRHA and NRCHA World Champion; Heavy Duty 
Chex – NRBC Non Pro Champion twice and earner of over $120,000 plus many many more.  
 
Nu Chex still resides at Hilldale Farm in Brashear, Texas. He is now 27 years young! Stop by and 
see him while you have the chance. He loves carrots and treats. Click here to read more about 
the history of Nu Chex To Cash.  
 
Nu Chex To Cash is retired from stud. There are no breedings available.  


